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ORDINANCE 20 22 - 0 1 - 1 3 - 0 0 0 5 
APPROVING A CONTRACT WITH ATLANTIC DIVING 
SUPPLY, INC., FOR MAIL SCREENING EQUIPMENT 
AND MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT FOR A TOTAL 
COST OF $96,208.44 FOR THE FINANCE DEPARTMENT, 
PRINT AND MAIL OPERATIONS DIVISION. FUNDING 
FOR THE MAIL SCREENING EQUIPMENT IN THE 
AMOUNT OF $67,201.84 AND FIRST YEAR OF 
MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT IN THE AMOUNT OF 
$5,801.32 IS AVAILABLE FROM AND INCLUDED IN THE 
FY 2022 - FY 2027 CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM. 
FUNDING FOR YEARS 2 THROUGH 5 IS SUBJECT TO 
THE APPROPRIATION OF SUBSEQUENT ANNUAL 
FUNDING. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City with mail screening equipment with the 
q1pability to conduct onsite mail screening to detect and report on the presence of potential mail­
borne threats, with -instant, live video scanning capability of the contents within the item being 
screened; and 

WHEREAS, Atlantic Diving Supply, Inc., submitted the low bid for a total cost of $96,208.44, 
which includes mail screening equipment, delivery, training, equipment manuals, assistance in 
developing standard operating procedures, remote support to help interpret unexpected images, 
and maintenance and support, which includes software updates, equipment repairs and 
calibration; and 

WHEREAS, all expendit~res will be in accordance with .the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bid submitted by Atlantic Diving Supply, Inc., to provide the City with mail 
screening equipment and maintenance and support for a total cost of $96,208.44 is hereby 
accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, 
insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation is attached hereto and incorporated 
herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. 

SECTION 2. Payment is authorized to be encumbered and made payable to Atlantic Diving 
Supply, Inc., in an amount not to exceed $73,003.16. Payment is in support of the City Tower 
Project using Fund 40099000 with the WBS element 23-01477-0607 and GL account 5201040. 
Funding for this project is provided by CO Bonds, Tax Notes, the Downtown City Office Fund, 
and the City Tower Tenant Improvement Fund and is in the FY 2022 - FY 2027 CIP Budget. 
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· P~xment is limit d. to · t~e amounts ~udgeted in the operating and/or capital budget funding 
"Sources identified'. All expenditures will comply with approved operating and/or capital budgets 
for current and future fiscal years. 

SECTION 3. Additional funding in the amount of $23,205.28, for years 2 through 5 1s 
contingent upon City Council approval of subsequent budgets within the term of the contract. 

SECTION 4. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy 
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may; subject 
to concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund 
Numbers, SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund 
Centers, SAP Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, 
and SAP GL Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 5. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more affirmative 
votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 13th day of January, 2022. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 



9. 

City of San Antonio 

City Council Meeting 
January 13, 2022 

2022-01-13-0005 
Ordinance approving a contract with Atlantic Diving Supply, Inc., for mail screening equipment 
and maintenance and support for a total cost of $96)08.44 for the Finance Department, Print and 
Mail Operations Division. Funding for the mail screening equipment in the amount of $67,201.84 
and first year of maintenance and support in the amount of $5,801.32 is available from and 

included in the FY 2022 - FY 2027 Capital Improvement Program. Funding for maintenance and 
support for years 2 through 5 is subject to the appropriation of subsequent annual funding. [Ben 
Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Councilmember Rocha Garcia moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Councilmember Cabello 
Havrda seconded the motion. The motion carried by thefollow~ng vote: 

A e: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello 
Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage, Perry 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

WITHDREW 
Opened: October 27, 2021 Non-Local Local Non-Local 
For: Mail Screening Equipment Atlantic Diving Supply, Inc Barbara Technologies RaySecur, Inc. 

Corporation 

6100014252 JS 621 Lynnhaven Pkwy 3800 NW Loop 410, Suite 105 356 University Drive 
Virginia Beach, VA 23452 San Antonio, TX 78229 Westwood, MA 02090 

Item Description Quantity 757-416-7526 

1 Raysecur 300 Mail Screening Equipment 
Price each year 1 $67,201 .84 $67,110.00 $72,888.45 
Total price $67,201 .84 $67,110.00 $72,888.45 

2 Year 1 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 
software updates, calibration, and operator certification 
Price each year 1 $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 $5,863.98 
Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00 $5,863.98 

3 Year 2 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 
software updates. calibration. and operator certification 
Price each year 1 $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 NO BID 
Total price $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 

4 Year 3 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 
software updates. calibration. and operator certification 
Price each year 1 $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 NO BID 
Total price $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 

5 Year 4 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 
software updates. calibration. and operator certification 
Price each year 1 $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 NO BID 
Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00 

6 Year 5 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 
software updates. calibration. and operator certification 
Price each year 1 $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 NO BID 
Total price $5,801 .32 $5,794.00 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Total $96,208.44 $96,080.00 $78,752.43 

Total Award $96,208.44 Incomplete 
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